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Health and Sport Committee 
NHS Board Accounts 2013-14 

Questionnaire Response from NHS Lothian 

Service development 

1. Please give THREE examples of service developments that: 

(a) you have been able to fund in 2013-14 (please list local service 

developments, rather than national programmes)  

 range of investments targeted at increasing capacity to 

address both planned and unscheduled care in acute and 

community services 

 investment in infrastructure 

 clinical staffing 

(b) you would like to develop if you had additional funding, i.e. what 

is next on your list of priorities?  

 Reprovision of fit for purpose inpatient accommodation to 

respond to growing needs of older people  

 Developing primary care and community services 

infrastructure 

 Funding of 7 day working across all specialties 

(c) you have withdrawn in 2013-14 (and why?).  

 We are engaged in an ongoing process of service 

redesign which inevitably changes the shape of services 

and how these are delivered.   

Preventative spending 

2. What specific preventative health programmes are included in your 

budget plans for 2013-14? (please give details of planned expenditure 

in 2013-14 compared with 2012-13.)  

A range of preventative health programmes are specifically funded by 

SGHD.  These are summarised in the table below: 
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Description 

Received 
2012/13 

Planned 
2013/14 

£k £k 

Child Healthy Weight Interventions 270 270 

Sexual Health  606 606 

Blood Borne Virus Framework  2,525 2,525 

Hepatitis C 1,993 1,993 

Smoking Cessation 1,311 1,311 

Smoking Prevention Action Plan 197 197 

Childsmile Core 1,642 1,642 

Childsmile Nursery, School and Practice 0 0 

Keep Well 1,200 1,200 

Alcohol Brief Interventions 796 796 

Family Nurse Partnerships 600 694 

      

Total 11,140 11,234 

 
The Board also provides Health Promotion Services which have a base 
recurrent budget of £1.5m.  Other programmes including breast, bowel, 
cervical and MRSA screening, infection control and vaccinations are 
embedded with the delivery of healthcare and hence planned spend is 
not separately monitored. 
 

3. Have you made any assessment of the potential longer term savings 

from preventative spending?  If so, please describe your approach to 

this modelling.  

Our agreed Strategic Clinical Framework, Health and Social Care 
integration, the integrated resource framework (IRF) and investment via 
the change fund are all levers to facilitate changes in service delivery.  
Whilst this in turn may lead to efficiencies no detailed modelling has 
been undertaken at this stage. 
 
Specifically we will review benefits from early years change fund and: 
early years collaborative, the outcomes from our work in safety in 
primary care and maternity patient safety and mental health.  We have 
began the process of reviewing our work in relation to those with 
physical and complex health and social care needs.   
 
We will be using information generated from the IRF to support 
decisions on the best way of delivering care and treatment in the future 
to a population of people who will grow and potentially live longer with a 
range of neuro-degenerative conditions such as epilepsy, MS, 
Parkinson's and Huntington's Disease etc.  We recognise that currently 
the spend in this range of conditions is significant and that there may 
be ways of managing conditions at different points in time. 
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4. How are the results of any such modelling reflected in your financial 

planning?  

Currently there is no explicit link. 

Access to new medicines  

5. In relation to spending on newly-licenced medicines (whether or not 

approved by the SMC), please complete the table below: 

As there is no accepted definition of a ‘newly licensed medicine’, for 
this excercise we have looked at medicines due to be reviewed by 
Scottish Medicines Consortium (SMC) in 2012/13 and 2013/14, based 
on the Forward Look reports published by the SMC.  
 
Most expenditure will occur in secondary care before moving out to 

primary care in subsequent years. 

 GP prescribing Hospital prescribing 

 £m £m 

2012-13 (planned) - 5.0 

2012-13 (actual) * * 

2013-14 (planned) 1.0 1.7 

 

*  We are unable to provide this information; the indication for 

prescribing is not recorded within our systems.  This would be required 

in order to provide the expenditure information. 

6. For each individual patient request agreed in 2012-13 (relating to 

newly-licenced medicines not recommended by the SMC), please 

complete the table below (please delete the example provided): 

Within NHS Lothian 41 IPTR cases for medicines were heard during 
the financial year 2012-2013 for 13 different medicines.  21 of these 
applications were approved. For 12 of the medicines approved within 
these IPTR applications there are fewer than 5 patients in total.  This 
level of detail cannot be released under FOI guidelines, since this could 
allow identification of individual patients.  Therefore specific details on 
these medicines cannot be supplied.  The detail for the other medicine 
is contained within the table below. 

 
It must also be noted that information on actual costs versus planned 
costs is not available; and is not required to be recorded as part of the 
IPTR process.  Whilst the IPTR application process requires an 
estimated cost for the course of therapy being requested, any 
subsequent spend on the medicine cannot be tracked to individual 
patient level or the indication for treatment (i.e. we do not have this 
information available from current electronic systems).   
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Request 

number 
Medicine Therapy area 

Actual cost 

2012-13 

Planned cost 

2013-14 

   £k £k 

7 Prucalopride GI 
£59.00/ 

month/patient* 

Information 

not recorded 

in electronic 

records 

 
* Unknown how many months patients actually received after approval 
via IPTR panel. 

Reducing inequalities  

7. (a) What specific services are aimed at reducing inequalities? (please 

include details of Keep Well). 

Services to reduce inequalities fall into one of two categories: 

payments to voluntary bodies to provide equalities services; or NHS 

Lothian’s internal provisions, including equality and diversity teams.  

Examples include interpretation and translation services, MEHIS 

(minority ethnic health inclusion service) and the Keep Well 

programme. 

(b) What is the level of spending on these services in 2012-13 and 

2013-14? 

NHS Lothian address health inequalities in a variety of ways, with a 

number of initiatives embedded in ongoing service delivery.  Therefore 

information on spending is not readily extracted. 

(c) What outcome measures have been identified for these services? 

Outcomes are monitored through:  

 Routine impact assessments which are carried out for all 

new and revised plans and policies; 

 The inclusion of explicit terms relating to equality and 

diversity in all contractual arrangements with voluntary 

sector service providers; 

 

(d) What information is available in relation to these outcomes? 

Examples include monitoring suicide rates per head of population; 

monitoring complaints about discrimination and harassment towards 
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staff; monitoring interpreting and translation outputs; number of 

properties achieving a satisfactory accessibility rating; number of GP 

practices offering out-of-hours services. 

Resource transfer  

8. (a) What level of funding will be transferred from your budget to local 

authorities in 2013-14 (i.e. resource transfer) and what services will 

these funds help deliver? 

Resource transfers for each local authority area are detailed below: 

  Edinburgh East Midlothian West Total 

  £000's £000's £000's £000's £000's 

        

HIV/AIDS 699 7 33 17 756 

Learning Disabilities 7,515 1,625 2,144 2,331 13,615 

Mental Health 2,769 176 896 1,937 5,778 

Older People 9,610 1,166 1,433 2,063 14,273 

Other (carers/alcohol, etc.) 85 122 34 39 279 

Physical Disabilities 13 4 6 4 28 

SNIP 10 0 0 0 10 

Other 119 0 0 128 247 

        

Totals 20,821 3,101 4,545 6,519 34,986 

 

(b) What level of funding will be transferred to your budget from local 

authorities in 2013-14 and what services will these funds help deliver? 

The change fund for 2013-14 (£c11.1m) will be invested in: 

 Enhancing current projects that support older people, 

reablement, joint intermediate care, further investments in 

care homes and step up/step down beds; 

 Projects designed to move forward the change in the balance 

of care; and 

 Support to carers and the third sector as part of the overall 

transformational process.  

In addition to the change fund and the £35m resource transfer detailed 

above, NHS Lothian make a  £1m contribution towards the Edinburgh 

Joint Older People’s strategy which funds community nursing, care at 

home and some care homes.  
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Equalities  

9. Can you provide any specific examples of how consideration of 

equalities issues has influenced budget decisions? 

All investment decisions are reviewed to assess their impact on health 

inequalities. 

Sustainable development  

10. Can you provide any specific examples of how the NHSScotland 

sustainable development strategy has influenced budget decisions? 

NHS Lothian has invested in a range of sustainable technologies 

through the infrastructure programme and actively invest to reduce 

carbon emissions. 

. 


